PADGETT & FREEMAN ARCHITECTS, PA
30 Choctaw Street
“Asheville, NC 28801

Wednesday, May 27, 2009
2:00 PM

Brevard High School Teilet Renovations
Transylvania County Board of Education

BID TABULATION

CONTRACTOR

NORTH
CAROLINA

LICENSE NO,

BID
SECURITY

BASE BID

Alfernate # 1

Alternate # 2

Alternate # 3

Alternate # 4

Alternate # 5

Remarks

A&B Construction & Development, Inc.
114 Sweeten Creek Road (PO Box 15370)
Asheville, NC 28803 (28813)

15288

5%

$93,575.00

$61,900.00

$580.00

$430.00

$630.00

$630.00

Appalachian Construction
351 Middlefork Branch Road
Rosman, NC 28772

N/A

No Bid Received

B. Allen Construction, Inc,
340 Wiggins Road (PO Box 797)
Candler, NC 28715

62592

5%

$120,000.00

$44,000.00

$494.00

$363.00

$0.00

$0.00

Carolina Contracling Services
170 8. Broad Street, Suite 5
Brevard, NC 28712

N/A

No Bid Received

Carolina Specialties Constroetion, L1.C
624 Tth Avenue (PO Box §25)
Hendersonville, NC 28739 (28793}

41451

3%

$79,952.00

$46,659.00

$543.00

$400.00

$0.00

$0.00

Dunlap Construetion, Inc,
7203 N. Grove Street
Hendersonville, NC 28792

42054

5%

$68,931.00

$51,663.00

$510.00

$376.00

$2,686.00

$1,343.00

H&M Constructors
{A Div. of MB Haynes Corp.)

187 Deaverview Road (PO Box 16589}
Asheville, NC 28806 (28816)

1245

5%

$92,100.00

$38,600.00

$500.00

$400.00

$435.00

$235.00

Maple Leaf Design & Build, Ine.
1364 US Hwy, 221N
Rutherfordion, NC 28139

66103

5%

$73,501.00

$52,700.00

$1,300.00

$440.00

$25.00

I certify that the bids recorded on pages 1-2 of this Bid Tabulation for the Brevard High Schoof Totlet Renovations were received at 2:00 pm, Wednesday,

10f2

ay 27, 2009,

Mithde! M. Freeman, AIA




PADGETT & FREEMAN ARCHITECTS, PA Wednesday, May 27, 2009 Brevard High School Toilet Renovations
30 Choctaw Street 2:00 PM Transylvania Ceunty Board of Education
Asheville, NC 28801

BID TABULATION
NORTIH
CAROLINA D
CONTRACTOR LICENSE NG. | SECURITY BASE BID Alternate # 1 Alternate # 2 Alternate # 3 Alternate # 4 Alternate # 5 Remarks
McCall Brothers Inc.
6700 Brookshive Blvd. N/A No Bid Received
Charlotte, NC 28213
MeCarroll Construction, Inc.
39 Loop Road (PO Box 400) 23121 5% $78,400.00 $40,900.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Arden, NC 28704

Patton Construction Group, Inc.
505 Long Shoals Road N/A No Bid Received
Arden, NC 28704

Progressive Contracting Co., Ine.
143 Charlotte Ave. 36100 5% $72,62500 $57,98300 $58400 $42900 $000 $000
Sanford, NC 27330

TA Hudsor Constraction Company

81 Old Corbin Mountain Road 45763 5% $77,265.00 $46,177.00 $561.00 $412.00 $0.00 $0.00
Zirconia, NC 28790

Walker Contracting Group of NC, LLC
1300 Tusnel Road 60053 3% $92,998.00 $45,200.00 $536.00 $396.00 $0.00 $0.00
Asheville, NC 28805

Alternate # 13
Adl work assacialed with the Media Center Toilets ag shown on the Drawings and described in the Specifications.

Alternate # 2:
Owner's preferred brand. Plambing items as scheduled on the Drawings. Alternate No. 2 is to be used in combination with the Base Bid.

Alternate # 3:
Owner's preferred brand. Plumbing items as scheduted on the Drawings, Alternate No. 3 is to be used in combination with Aliernate Ne. |,

Alternate # 4:
Owaer's prefersed brand. Sloan 1HD SO Hand Bryers. Alternate No. 4 is 10 be used in combination with the Base Bid.

Alternate # 5
Owner's preferred brand. Sloan EHD 503 Hand Dryers. Allernate No. 5 is e be used in combination with Alternate No. 1.
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